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MADISON COUNTY
EMERGENCY MANAGEMENT AGENCY

Butch Hammack, Director ® bhammack@madison-co.com

Date: March 8, 2013

To: Madison County Board of Supervisors

From: Butch Hammac@

Re: Road Claim
Industrial Rd., NE
Deborah Reynolds

Our office received a road claim for Deborah Reynolds on February 11, 2013. We have
investigated the incident and it is our office’s recommendation that this claim be paid in the

amount of $741.15. It was found the road was in need of repair and was not repaired within a 7
days period stated in the Road Policy.

Attached is paperwork regarding the claim for your viewing.

601-859-4188 ® Fax: 601-859-4743 @ 125 West North Street ® Post Office Box 608 ® Canton, Mississippi 39046



ROAD CLAIM INCIDENT REPORT
In order to process claim, please print & fill out completely, then return to Madison County Road Dept. or
Madison Co. EMA office along with two signed estimates for damages being claimed.
Personal
Date: <Q l 1 \" \3
Inf ti
ormation Name:EQ/\Q &-\N)&/\ Q‘?)ﬂ V\@\Ol.g
Mailing Address:
% \
1012 Wildhive Dp
WAL Co e _Ims 39b4t
Contact #: 679(/’ = S*‘S"Gi "‘L) g l’b
Make/ Model of Vehicle: =010} 3\0‘3 &'La Co vmmj
Incident Please answer questions below in relations to the incident being
of reported:
nformation : :
Dateig*j‘“ \F)) Time: H?;O;,oW\
Location: _on U{%J*K\QL (ZO\ WE
(name of road incident occurred)
Area Landmarks: 9 GP{WV\CI,Q,U £ L;De,g T ave o
Approx. Speed at time of incident: !D A% l_l)}r\
Direction of Travel: SE
Cause of Incident: ‘pf)u\-\‘)\ 0
(ie: pothole, rock, etc..)
Area of vehicle damaged: Poﬁsev\q o fosip Tire { ‘Q 13
Incident Please write a brief summary of the incident (use back if needed):
Summary S‘\’LOPPQC?’ C‘Vg‘ S\‘L‘W/’ Y {g\‘ﬁ -~ Tu U@V\Q_Qg
cyhtot Slopsyh —Passeng ¢/~
ﬁe.m/" \“i v \“@'QA{ ] mg%) \064’{/{{)[? -
Ture imwmesliately slarted Yosing
ar - weat 3D Puillnny Wre - chrang ed
Jure o spare - Tiee cawaotbe
repawed and M is damaged -
Rland neid \) ol C;f\“é .
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OFFICE USE ONLY:

Received by: Dept:
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Parkway Quicklube & Tires Ticket: 20482

538 Denim Way Date:

Gluckstadt, MS 39046 InPr 0gress CRE VL0 s S
601 856 0808 , '

Customer Information. . -~ - . = -vehicle Information
Deberah Reynolds ’ YEAR 2012 VIN 4T1BFIFK8CU193027
1018 Hillshire Dr . MAKE TOYOTA LICENSE NEW
MCCOMB, MS 39648 MODEL CAMRY MILEAGE 4,000

ENGINE 2.5L 4-CYL (2AR-FE) FIOIL TYPE
: o " Service History

o Fleet Information S
SALE DATE MILEAGE SERVICE

P.O. Number:
. SERVICE:CHECKLIST . . D,ESCR;[PTION ~|© PART | QTY. | PRICE| AMOUNT
|JOEM TOYOTA 18IN RIM Z556963 NONSTK 1.00 53334 53334
225/45R 17 MICH MXM4 NONSTK 1.00  225.00 225.00
State Tire Tax STT 100 1.00 1.00
| Tire Disposal ™ 1.00 4.00 4.00
. . ..SubTotal 763.34
Ticket Notes: Coupon 0.00
Discount 0.00
Sale 763.34
Taxable Amt 763.34
: ' Sales Tax 53.43
Total 816.77
7 x » . - . & .
Signed X > ; : ) )
Balance Due 816.77
Change Due 0.00

( Py



AVES TIRE & ACT

™ o™ ™ e e i

604 SPRINGRIDGE RD DEBRA REYNOLDS

CLINTON, MS 39056 1018 HILLSHIRE DR

601-925-4711 Fax 601-925-4713 McComb, MS 39648
~ [IGENSE

MILEAGE DUE

DATE DUE

SERVICE SCHEDULE

CHECKLIST ITEM STATUS

207i2013

03939 2254518 MIC PRIMACY MXM4
DOT# 4612 (1)

FREE MOUNT & BALANCE-NEW
TIRES

1741350 NEW VALVE STEM-IF
APPLICABLE

Tire protection plan:
Accept
Decline

© *Retofnimended - DEM 18 INC WHEEL

© MISS. TIRE TAX

TIRE DISPOSAL FEE

SUBTOTAL
SALES TAX

PAYMENT - VISA

SERVICE REMARKS: -

1 mic tire at 193.95

' |

4
| hereby authorize the repair work to betlone along with the necessary

materials.| grant you and/or your employees premission to operate the vehicle
for the purpose of testing.

AMOUNT TENDERED

CHANGE DUE

1 19395 19395

1
1
e
1.00

2.50

197.45
13.75

CUSTOMER SIGNATURE




Jennifer Taylor

From: Jennifer Taylor <jennifer.taylor@madison-co.com>
Sent: Friday, March 08, 2013 4:00 PM

To: Shirley Brown (shirley.brown@madison-co.com)
Subject: Road Claim

We investigated claims on Sutherland Rd. and Industrial Rd., NE. Butch and Albert investigated and | also received the
report from Helen. We wanted to report to your department, that both of these roads have several repairs that are
needed. | wanted to pass that information along.

Thank you and have a great weekend!

Jennifer Toylor
Administrative Assistant

Madison County Board of Supervisors
Emergency Management Office

0: 601-855-5620

C: 601-259-2260



